
 

 

  

 



 

 

 

 

  

  

  

Upon entering this beautifully appointed family home one is welcomed into a spacious hallway that 
sets the tone for the generous proportions found throughout the property. Directly to your right is the 
elegant sitting room, a super dual-aspect space flooded with natural light, featuring French doors 
which open onto a patio area overlooking the front garden. Adjacent is the formal dining room, 
another dual aspect room with French doors to the garden, but with additional direct access to the 
kitchen next door. This space could also serve as a wonderful office, studio, or playroom 
 
The kitchen / breakfast room is a real heart-of-the-home space, thoughtfully laid out with a central 
island and a wealth of storage and preparation areas in the attractive wooden cupboards which offer 
integrated appliances as well as a range oven. Flowing from here is the bright and airy breakfast 
room, featuring French doors that open to the garden and a superb, vaulted ceiling, creating an 
inviting informal dining area. A connecting door leads back to the hallway, allowing for excellent 
circulation.  
 
To the right of the hall is a versatile study or fourth bedroom, offering an ideal work-from-home 
solution or flexible guest accommodation. Towards the rear of the ground floor is the principal 
bedroom suite, an impressively sized room benefitting from a private en suite shower room and 
ample built-in storage. A separate WC is accessed from the hallway. Upstairs, the first floor 
comprises two further well-proportioned double bedrooms, the second bedroom is particularly 
spacious and enjoys views over the gardens and surrounding area. Bedroom three is located at the 
front and includes en-suite shower room and access to eaves storage, enhancing practicality. There 
is also a modern family bathroom on this level.  
 
The garden is a charming, well-established outdoor space offering a wonderful sense of privacy and 
seclusion. Thoughtfully landscaped over several levels, it features a series of terraced patios ideal 
for al fresco dining and entertaining, with mature planting, fruit trees, and a brick-built pizza oven 
adding both character and practicality. A combination of raised beds, trellising, and secluded 
seating areas creates a tranquil retreat, perfect for enjoying the warmer months.  
 
The property is offered chain free. 



 

 

  

  

  

  

   



 

 

 

 

 

 

  


